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Bandit Big Rig Series – Cancels event at Kalamazoo Speedway 
 
 
Blooming Prairie, MN - The most exciting race series on oval tracks has made the 
tough decision to cancel their event slated for August 7th at Kalamazoo Speedway.  
Due to continued business issues with the big rig series, the decision was made to 
move the event until a future date. 
 
Jason Johnson, GM of the Bandit Big Rig Series, noted his displeasure as the 
excitement for a return to the ZOO since their inaugural 2019 race has grown.  
“Kalamazoo Speedway is an A+ facility, to have the opportunity to race on the home 
track of the Klash is one of those on the schedule that was a can’t wait, as it was a 
must do with the race teams to come back and battle on the famed 3/8-mile track,” 
said Johnson.  With issues that arose in late May and have continued, the race slated 
for August 7th became a serious issue and has been in jeopardy of not happening 
since.  With unclear answers still to the issues, the only fair thing to do for the fans 
who have this event circled on their calendar was to make the tough decision that 
the race in August would have to be cancelled.  “It’s never easy, especially with so 
many things in place, a lot of fan buildup and of course the weekend hotspot for 
action, Kalamazoo is one event that hurts to not be putting on, it’s for sure 
something we wished we’d not have to be doing” Johnson stated.  Bandit Big Rig 
Series does hope to schedule a future date and get back over to Kalamazoo 
Speedway sometime in the future.   
 
About Bandit Big Rig Series  
 
The Bandit Big Rig Series brings back big rig truck racing to the short track in the 
United States. The series was designed to be affordable and accessible for anyone 
wishing to put together a race team, and something new and exciting for the average 
fan.  
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